
Audubon Park

n 1007 27th Ave. NE 
Moving sale! Crate & 
Barrel patio furn., boxing 
bag + stand, grill, lawn 
mower, snow blower, 
ladders, tools, sizes 
12/14 formal gowns, 
artwork, and more! 
n 1201 27th Ave. 
NE Electronics, dolls, 
glassware - Coca-Cola 
items, shoes, clothes, 
old car parts (Ford).
H 1401 27th Ave. NE 
Sale begins Thursday 
10-6. Open Fri. 8-5. 
Vintage hh, clothing, 
fishing lures, costume 
jewelry, Red Wing 
crocks, lots of variety. 
n 1513 26th Ave. NE 
Sale in alley, home 
décor, frames, dec. 
flowers, women’s 
clothing size 8/medium, 
chairs, antique oak 
dresser, pounds of 
sorted seashells, cheap/
free quirky stuff for your 
creative mind.
n 2518 Hayes St. NE 
Aquarium supplies, 
kids toys, kids clothes 
sizes 4T-5T and boys 
10-12, bead making 
supplies and beads, and 
crocheted crafts.
n 2634 Pierce St. NE 
Books, housewares, 
clothes, kids stuff, misc.
n 2646 Benjamin St. 
NE Men’s & women’s 
clothing S-L, sporting 
goods, outdoor gear, hh, 
plants.
n 2653 Stinson Blvd. 
Home goods, misc. 
items, clothing.
n 2647 McKinley St. 
NE Front yard and 
moving sale inside. 

Some furn., toys, 
glassware, books, 
records, and tons of 
misc. Open Fri. and Sat. 
9 am-5 pm.
n 2715 McKinley 
St. NE Canning jars, 
adult clothing, gifts, 
wicker baskets, gift tins, 
kitchenware and more. 
Also open Sun., 11 am-5 
pm.
l 2823 Garfield St. 
NE Framed art, original 
stained glass, poetry 
books, broadsides & 
zines, collage prints, 
original design note 
cards, earrings, hh 
goods, sm. appliances, 
misc. items.
H 2834 Garfield St. 
NE Sale in alley. Toys, 
games, baby items, 
books, kitchenware, 
décor, clothing: girls (all 
sizes) women’s (S,M), 
mens (XL).
n 2950 Ulysses St. 
NE Petite size women’s 
clothing, LBD’s, national 
and international 
brands, shoes, vases, 
baskets, etc.
l 3019 Pierce St. NE 
Clothes, pictures, hh 
items.

Beltrami

n 431 Pierce St. NE 
Super sale, snow blower 
Toro, hh items, holiday 
hh, furn. and clothes.

Bottineau

l 2430 California St. 
NE Lowry NE Flea 
Market, 12 vendors with 
a large variety of items. 
Open Sat. only, 10 am-5 
pm, Sunday is the rain 
date.

Holland

 

l 631 19th Ave. NE 
Gnarled by Nature - 
Handmade metaphysical 
enchantments and 
jewelry with nature 
themes. 
H 807 Lowry Ave. NE 
Femme clothes XS-M, 
femme shoes size 7, 
housewares, craft items! 
Parking on Quincy or 
Jackson is easiest! Walk 
to yellow house, to the 
backyard. 
n 1711 4th St. NE 
Wood crafts by Bob 
Jensen, hand turned 
exotic bowls, collectible 
antique Stanley tools, 
furn., lumber, power 
tools, plants, 2002 Buick 
Century. Open Fri. and 
Sat. 6 am-3 pm. 
n 2308 7th St. NE 
Moving sale, hh items, 
tools, glass craft items, 
furn. 
l 2513 Monroe St. NE 
Fabric, vintage buttons, 
sewing items, old 
Singer sewing machine, 
seashells, jewelry, 
handcrafted blank 
cards, sale in front yard, 

if raining on back porch. 
Open Sat 8 am-1 pm. 
n 2526 Jackson St. 
NE Sale in back alley. 
Bought out estate 
sale, Pier 1 wicker 
BR set, white wicker 
trundle bed, art pieces, 
Gabberts table and 
chairs, retro, vintage, 
cool and groovy, anime 
and video game pins, 
Fri. 9 am-5 pm and Sat. 
10 am-5 pm.
n 2642 Quincy St. 
NE Moving out sale, 
TVs, furn., kitchen 
appliances, clothes and 
more. 
n 2644 Washington St. 
NE Lawn edging, golf 
set Sam Snead, new 
Rossignol skis, power 
washer 6.5 hp 2200 PSI 
and One Electrical tools 
and much more. 
n 2646 Central Ave. 
NE Backyard sale, 
military, poker table, golf 
set, tools, tackle, hh, 
coats, Xbox game chair, 
other stuff. 

Logan Park 

n 677 13th Ave. NE 
Clothing, hh items, 
pictures, 2 antique 
radios, garage and yard/
plant items, cat condo, 
pet supplies, half price 
on Saturday from 1-5 
pm.

H  Open Friday only
l  Open Saturday only
n  Open Fri. and Sat.

Friday, June 16 and
Saturday, June 17

Sales in Northeast Mpls., Columbia Heights, St. Anthony 
Some sales are also open earlier or later in the week, so study up and plan your route today!

Rain date: Sunday, June 18

Most sales open both 
days, 8 a.m.-5 p.m.

For an easy-to-print sale list find PDFs posted on  
www.MyNortheaster.com (if you’re reading this paper online) and on 

Facebook at https://www.facebook.com/NEighborsGarageSaleWeekend

More sale 
listings  

on Page 13

Be sure to thank  
these businesses  
on pages 4 and 13 

for sponsoring  
the Sale Days  

while you’re out 
shopping!

Use the interactive 
map found at the  
QR code or web 

address below to 
find your next  

treasure at the 2023 
NEighbors Sale Days

700 Central Avenue NE • Minneapolis
www.relishmpls.com • 612-223-8983

open early to late!! 

Sunday - Thursday 7am-10pm • Friday - Saturday 7am-11pm

#Revamp
#Repurpose

#Renew!

www.mynortheaster.com/
neighbors-garage-sale-2023/

4   Northeaster | June 14, 2023



Marshall Terrace

n 2722 Grand St. 
NE HH items, jewelry, 
holiday lights and dec., 
clothing (some vintage).
n 3001 Grand St. NE 
Huge sale! Antiques, 
new kitchen cookware, 
men’s and women’s 
clothes, boy’s clothes, 
infant-3 yr., bit of 
everything, baseball 
cards, beer tap handles 
& misc., albums, CDs, 
shoes, & much more! 
Open Wed.-Sat. 9 am-5 
pm.

Sheridan &  
St. Anthony West

Sheridan 
n 1334 6th St. NE 
Tools, copper pipes, 
electronic cords/
keyboard, roll top desk, 
regular desk, clothes/
shoes, art supplies, 
books. 
St. Anthony West 
l 416 8th Ave. NE 
Furn., women’s clothes 
(med.), accessories, 
vintage items, jewelry, 
books, misc. hh. Open 
Sat. 10 am-6 pm.

Waite Park

n 3058 Arthur St. 
NE Moving sale - lg. 
furn. and name brand 
clothing (Columbia, 
Ann Taylor, etc.), misc. 
kitchen, hh items and 
toys.
n 3123 McKinley St. 
NE Yard/garage sale! 
Furn., clothing, hh 
items, sporting goods 
and memorabilia and 
much more!
n 3130 Lincoln St. NE 
Art, clothes, hh goods, 
posters, multi-family 
sale.
n 3215 Lincoln St. 
NE Sale in Alley. Many 
jewelry making supplies, 
mostly semi-precious 
gemstone pieces. Some 
hh decorations.
n 3258 Cleveland St. 
NE Multi-family sale with 
proceeds benefitting 
Deaf Ministry at Our 
Lady of Mt. Carmel 
Catholic Church.
n 3258 Polk St. NE 
Huge multi-family sale. 
Something for everyone.
n 3301 Pierce St. NE 
Bedroom/kitchen furn., 
clothes and shoes, 
games and books.
n 3306 Johnson St. 
NE Books, women’s and 
boys/girls clothes, furn., 
bikes, games and more! 
Open Fri. 8 am-5 pm 
and Sat. 8 am-2 pm.
n 3306 Tyler St. NE 
HUGE sale. Rusty, 
dusty, tons of misc. 
items. Old and new and 
much more. Also open 
Thurs. 8 am-5 pm and 
Sun. 8 am-5 pm.
n 3314 Tyler St. NE 
Lefty cross-stitch, art, 
books, records, women’s 
clothes S/M/L, baby 
clothes/toys. Bring kids, 
we have bubbles!
n 3318 Ulysses St. NE 
Misc. clothes, kitchen 
items, some old items, 
some new items.

n 3446 Lincoln St. NE 
Wedding decorations, 
hh, teacher items, small 
furn. Open Fri. & Sat. 9 
am-4pm.
n 3456 Benjamin St. 
NE Lots of treasures! 
Do a jig at checkout 
and receive a dollar off 
purchase!
n 3547 McKinley St. 
NE Pub tables, garbage 
disposal, hh items, tools.
n 3538 Benjamin St. 
NE Rockin’ sale: Many 
records, music t-shirts, 
collectibles, hh, puzzles, 
antiques and women’s/
teen clothing.
l 3555 Buchanan 
St. NE HH goods 
(mostly kitchen and 
home office), clothes, 
electronics.

Windom Park

 

n 1612 23rd Ave. NE 
Sale in back. Some 
antiques, tobacianna, 
general hh, boys & girls 
(teen) clothes, vintage 
end tables, books, 
women’s “Lulu” bike, 
Radio Flyer wagon,  
vintage costume jewelry, 
multi family.
n 1616 23rd Ave. NE 
Antiques, furn., toys, 
tools, hh goods, décor, 
snow blower, bikes and 
much more.
n 1838 Lincoln St. 
NE HH, tools, ladies’ 
clothing, shoes, some 
furn., etc. 
l 1918 Walden Place 
NE Estate sale open 
Sat. and Sun. 9 am-4 
pm.
n 1942 Hayes St. NE 
Antiques, fishing 
lures, bike, craft 
supplies, Mikasa 
China, Art Deco: 
rocking chair, 
barcart, lamp, 
trunk. Open Fri. 
12-4pm, Sat. 
9am-3pm. 

n 2200 Taft St. NE 
HH items, vintage and 
antiques, open Fri. and 
Sat. 9 am-4 pm.
l 2339 Benjamin 
St. NE Construction 
materials and 
housewares and other 
misc.
n 2358 McKinley St. 
NE House cleaning sale! 
Kids toys & clothes, 
women’s clothes, 
kitchen items & cookier 
tools, scrap wood & 
shelving, plus free 
items! Also open Sun., 8 
am-5 pm.
 

St. Anthony  
Village

 

n 2912 Roosevelt St. 
NE Lots of bikes, few 
laptops and monitors, 
IKEA, cat goodies, 
garden gear, cello, 
kitchen accessories.
n 3308 Belden Dr. 
NE HH items, games, 
puzzles, décor, 
collectibles, and so 
much more!
n 4000 Penrod Lane 
Housewares, adult 
clothes, and much more!

Columbia 
Heights

H 3839 Hart Blvd. 
Various vendors - “Hart 
Lake summer craft fair 
and boutique.” Friday 
only 10 am-5 pm.

H  Open Friday only
l  Open Saturday only
n  Open Fri. and Sat.

Most sales open both days, 8 a.m.-5 p.m.

Friday, June 16 and
Saturday, June 17

More sale 
listings  

on Page 4

Rain date: Sunday, June 18

2315 18th Ave NE  612-789-0678 
(corner of 18th & Stinson) 

Formerly Annona Gourmet

Cold Press Coffee on the Patio!
Olive Oil • Vinegar • Coffee • Specialty Foods

NEW - World Spices & Herbs • Dried Mushrooms
www.curiouserfoods.com • 612-354-2927

2900 
Pentagon 
Drive NE   

St. Anthony 
Shops 
Center

Save your cash
for garage sales.  

Finance your next home
 improvement project with a
zero-interest loan from the  

Waite Park Community Council. 

mncee.org/waitepark 
612-335-5884

MELISSA MOUND

612-462-9552
MelissaMound@edinarealty.com

MAKE YOUR MOVE
WITH MELISSA!

Scan the 
QR Code 
and go  
to our 

Interactive 
Map!
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